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Abstract – This neighborhood system in the article of activity economic the basics 
improvement issues The Mahalla Institute economic opportunities development , its socio-
economic stability in the provision place analysis Research neighborhood funds during 
formation , financial from funds effective use and the neighborhood budget diversification to 
do according to practical offer and recommendations working Also , international 
experiments studied , local to the conditions suitable innovative approaches offer This 
research on the neighborhood system economic stability reinforcement and their in society 
social functions further effective to do service does .
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Introduction - Neighborhood system Uzbekistan national to oneself originality and social 
structure inseparable part is , its development of the state socio-economic to the stability 
directly impact shows . Last in years neighborhoods society in life role increasing , their 
economic the basics reinforcement current to the point The Mahalla Institute economic 
opportunities expansion not only their financial independence increases , maybe in the 
regions population well-being to provide service This will do . the neighborhood system in 
the article develop on the way economic problems solution to do and this regarding effective 
mechanisms current of reaching theoretical and practical basics is illuminated .

Literature review Joseph Stieglitz , Nobel Prize prize-winner economist , self in research 
economic in development inequality reduce and social stability provide to the issues big 
attention He focused on his " Globalization and Its Discontents" and other in his works local 
level economic management social and economic effects deep analysis does.Joseph Stieglitz's
thoughts and search results . Joseph Stieglitz economic development and social stability 
issues in learning economic PCB to provide main goal as shows . His in my opinion , like a 
neighborhood local management systems economic resources fair in distribution and 
population economic opportunities in expansion important role plays . Stieglitz research this 
shows that economic inequality reduction at the neighborhood level entrepreneurship develop
and of the state targeted financial support through done increased.His stating that the 
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neighborhood system efficiency increase for state policy local management to the organs 
financial independence and resources in management freedom create necessary . Through this
neighborhoods economic in terms of stable divided , population between poverty reduce and 
economic activity to increase Stieglitz 's results this shows that local management and state 
cooperation through economic to grow achieve possible . With this together , resources 
effective distribution and infrastructure develop local the economy to strengthen service 
does . Conclusion as in other words , Stieglitz scientific research local at the level economic 
opportunities expansion , entrepreneurship develop and of the state supportive policy on the 
road to put through economic and social to stability achieve possible These principles 
underpin the mahalla system . economic the basics in improvement current practical 
importance has . [1]

Abdullaev Shavkat mahalla system socio-economic in life place and his/her importance about
take went in the research of the Mahalla Institute himself himself/herself management 
mechanisms improvement importance record The scholar will support the neighborhood 
funds . effective management and financial from resources reasonable use through 
neighborhoods economic independence increase opportunities research did . His in their work
, as well as in the neighborhoods state from the budget independent to be achieve for local 
income sources formation The issues of the mahalla economy were also covered . Anvar 
Kudratov and his/her society in management instead deep learned . He himself in research 
neighborhoods financial resources diversification to do main direction as emphasizing , 
income sources multiplication according to effective mechanisms offer Kudratov 's in my 
opinion , neighborhoods not only social institute as , maybe economic resources manager 
independent system formation as well as necessary . Abdullaev and Kudratov's thoughts each 
other fills , because they are part of the neighborhood system economic the basics 
improvement through his/her stable activity to conduct to provide general goal as These 
scientists research neighborhoods financial independence increase and social infrastructure to
develop aimed at scientific the basics in formation important importance has . [2,3]

Methodology:

Primary research Syrdarya province of the neighborhood system economic the basics study 
during of the 12 neighborhoods in the region activity analysis This was done . in research 
neighborhoods financial status , income sources , resources management methods and socio-
economic in projects participation deep studied . During the analysis It was found that the 
Syrdarya in the province neighborhoods main income sources optional contributions , state 
subsidies and from neighborhood properties removable to income based on . With this 
together , neighborhoods financial to the stability obstacle doing one row problems In 
particular , most in the neighborhoods financial of resources management enough effective 
not being observed . Most in cases there is resources complete unused remains or wrong is 
being distributed . Research cover received in 40 percent of neighborhoods small 
entrepreneurship develop according to there is opportunities to work not included was 
determined . As a result of this local income sources limited to be remains . With this together
, state by separated subsidies efficiency increase for them control to do and targeted spend 
system enough unformed . Neighborhoods infrastructure develop problems with available . 
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Neighborhoods most infrastructure in improvement private sector with effective cooperation 
on the road sheep As a result of this population infrastructure with cover low level of uptake 
remains . Therefore in the neighborhoods economic projects done in increasing public-private
partnership develop as a pressing issue Research during taken results neighborhoods 
economy and management system develop for scientific basis to be service This will do . 
search results local management in the system innovative mechanisms current to grow and 
financial from resources effective use on the road to put help gives .

Secondary research – The mahalla system in Uzbekistan in 2024 economic the basics to 
improve aimed at one row measures done The neighborhood system was increased . for 
economic and financial reinforcement strategy within the framework of the neighborhoods 
separable budget funds noticeable at the level In particular , the mahalla budget in 2024 
separable parts 3 times increase in the eye caught is , this is the neighborhood system to 
employees additional economic opportunities creates . Neighborhoods economic from 
resources effective use provide In order to , " Open " budget " system is also in place was 
done , this and the neighborhood system transparency and efficiency to increase service 
does . From this except for Urgench on August 9, 2024 Neighborhood system in the city 
employees day celebrated , this the event was attended by the community system population 
with at work successes and to him/her shown state of help importance separately The event 
highlighted the "Neighborhood Seven " system . current that was done and short on occasion 
his/ her own positive the effect shown confession This system neighborhood economic and 
social potential to increase aimed at new approaches previously Also , in 2024, the 
neighborhood system employees for award fundraiser organization was done , this and the 
activities of the neighborhood efficiency to increase help The fund will provide 600 million 
soums . in the amount of be , neighborhood, education institutions , and other in organizations
worker employees to encourage directed .

Result Syrdarya of the activities of 12 neighborhoods in the region economic analysis 
results , neighborhood system economic the basics improvement according to one row 
scientific to conclusions take arrived . Analyzed neighborhoods economic in their activities 
noticeable differences existence identified . Some neighborhoods village farm and industry 
small industries , for example , handicrafts and small business to develop successful was if , 
others state by presented done economic programs and grants using social projects done 
Increased the local economy various socio-economic to the conditions looking at developed , 
economic efficiency provide for inter-neighborhood cooperation and resources effective 
management the necessity showed . From this in addition , in research state programs to the 
local economy Analysis of the impact was done . To the neighborhoods separable financial 
resources , loans and benefits efficiency increased although , this of the system complete 
performance for neighborhoods organizational structure and financial abilities improvement 
is required . The state social services show system in neighborhoods economic stability in 
providing important place Also , the neighborhood system community organizations in 
development and public activity , as well as economic to activities youth and women 
attraction of reaching importance important importance has . Analysis results this shows that 
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the neighborhood system effective performance and economic stability in providing 
neighborhoods organizational potential reinforcement necessary ..

Analysis . Syrdarya of 12 neighborhoods in the region economic activity analysis to do 
through the neighborhood system economic the basics in improvement important importance 
has was one row factors determined . Analysis results this shows that neighborhoods 
economic in terms of various development to the level has is , this differences neighborhoods 
socio-economic to the conditions and there is from resources how to use depends on . Some 
neighborhoods village farm , small business and handicraft in the fields effective 
development indicators presented if so , others and economic in activity active participation 
without mainly state by given help and to grants relies on . So so , the local economy and 
his/her development level many in terms of there is resources how to manage related that it 
was shows the neighborhood system economic opportunities in evaluation state of programs 
role separately importance In the study , the state by to neighborhoods presented done 
financial assistance , loans and grants efficiency analysis done . To the results because of this 
programs in the neighborhoods economic activity to increase help gives , but bureaucratic 
obstacles and resources shortage problems , some in the neighborhoods their complete done 
increase is limiting . From this come came out without , state of programs effective 
performance for neighborhoods organizational opportunities improve , they for special 
manuals and trainings organization to grow necessity Also , the analysis during inter-
neighborhood differences further deeper studied . Some in the neighborhoods economic 
activity high this is on the ground small and middle business networks developing if , else in 
the neighborhoods economic activity is low This situation remains . neighborhoods 
organizational opportunities , resources effective use level and to neighborhoods separated 
financial of resources distribution with closely It depends on the neighborhood . economic 
development encouragement for their own resources further effective management and new 
business opportunities create important importance has . From this in addition to local 
organizations role analysis was done . Neighborhood organizations effective in operation 
organizational resources and public active participation important from factors one is 
considered . In the study As shown , some in the neighborhoods public economic to activities 
attraction to be done high level , especially among young people and women to 
entrepreneurship attraction in doing noticeable positive results record However , other in the 
neighborhoods this low activity level this is The state of the neighborhood economy to 
develop negative impact showing . So so that the neighborhood system development for , 
especially , young people and women entrepreneurship to their activities attraction to grow 
and this in the field more opportunities create Neighborhoods economic in development 
financial the opportunities are also great role plays .

Discussion In the study , neighborhoods separated funds inflation and other external factors 
under the influence own value loss and economic stability in providing problems brought 
release This is shown . means that the neighborhoods separated financial resources further 
effective and own on time distribution necessary . Also , in the neighborhood system there is 
resources management and from them maximum at the level use important importance At the 
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same time , the neighborhood system economic the basics improvement for , to 
neighborhoods further more financial and organizational help show , neighborhood and state 
between cooperation further strengthening , in neighborhoods the youth and women 
economic to activities attraction to , and economic stability provide for neighborhoods 
resources effective management necessity separately These measures are neighborhoods 
economic development encouragement and their stable to develop service does .

Conclusion. The neighborhood system economic the basics improvement , social and 
economic stability provide for important importance has . Research results this showed that 
the neighborhood system economic activity in increasing one row main factors , including 
neighborhoods from resources effective use , state of programs impact , community 
organizations role , and public economic to activities attraction to be such as aspects 
separately importance profession The neighborhood system economic development 
improvement for , first Next , to the neighborhoods being allocated financial resources and of 
help effective management need . In the study as shown , in the neighborhoods economic of 
activity various level development , their to resources and state to programs how much 
effective has to the fact that The neighborhood system economic the basics in improvement 
state and between the neighborhood cooperation strengthening , as well as resources effective
distribution and them complete use necessary . Also , in the neighborhood system youth and 
women entrepreneurship to their activities attraction economic development encouraging 
important factor as separated The public economic activity increase for gender and to age 
related opportunities expansion , as well as in neighborhoods economic activities supportive 
organizational and financial the system reinforcement As a result , the neighborhood system 
economic the basics improvement for complex approach Neighborhoods between economic 
the differences reduction , social and economic changes done increase , resources effective 
management and state programs optimization this of the process main structural parts is 
considered . Of these all neighborhood stable economic development provide and his/her 
social to stability added contribution to increase service does .
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